I Fo o TeA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
9 [[—EUS 3—39-TUE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

U | YehtioTd
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

H. 883] 73 feoett gear, fewmer 12, 2018/3WEM™UT 21, 1940
No. 883] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 12, 2018/AGRAHAYANA 21, 1940

Qe 3T gRE T HATET
(FaTeey S qfaTe SeaTor fawm)

FfegEeT
7% faeett, 12 femraw, 2018

Ar.FA, 1193(37).—= ot =iie y=Ted arRit 729, 1945 &1 37 Hergs F7 & forw swfaug [zt
FT &Y, U T THTE ATHIT AT, 1940 (1940 FT 23) Fif g7 12 ¥ 9T 33 &l ATATTHAT
T % TSI, FFTEIR, 91 11, &< 3, IT-9< (i) 5 TFgay, 2018 H AT qLFT % wreed T qhan
FATIT HATAT (FATEL 3T TATE FHedTor T |TT) it SIferg=er €. |, 1000(30), aa 5 Feav, 2018
FIT WeRTTrT ohm aro o, fome 3 iy saieat &, ek sae wafea g Y 59meEr €, 39 aria J, e
3T ATAFAAT 1 TS0 AT AT STAATLTT FT ITAH F05 T2 AT, G5 o H¥ s1atey & a9 5 14,
AT ST qATT A= B T o,

AT, T it IIAAT ST 10 SrFgay, 2018 Fi Iqere gl TS 4,

T, SFT MFHT 92 STETEOr F GTed Al S AT 9L Heatd qene gy G w7 o
T

AT: AT, FralT T, AT T TETLT AT A=, 1940 (1940 =1 23) Fit &m<T 12 /7T 41T
33 BT Jac ARl FT TANT Fd gU, SAU(er T ol TATehIT are § T FTd 6 GeATq urd 37
ST AT TS, 1945 FT i Helrerd wed & forw At Faw aamr 8, aaiq-

1. (1) == F=ret =1 91 Srafer i sEmee qrnR (SEt gora) Fam, 2018 #
(2) T ST § Ik TR T AT HT TG gl

7286 GI1/2018 (hH



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

. Siruter Ue yETee ATt e, 1945 (59 =6 <609 T 35 AW #gr 1A 8), F w24 7, -
(F) 3u-FA=m (1) ¥, -
(i) “uFer Sfuter & forT UF gT TUC 3T |7 U0 6 a7 T AT ok AT 6 I+ T,
“TaReT STITE % 7T 30 g T9Q 3T U golTe ®UT T a7 & ATdTh [k 961 T ST,
(i) T, “UF | EIU” TG h T qL ¢ UF gATE I 95 T A,
(@) I9-fF=w (3) ®, “F1 | TATE T FT AT AT ST QT6a1 6 €9 9T “ATS8d § F9eT
I & [T e g 979 | €9 T SR 63T SITUIIT A1 9758 T ST |
. S fm w24 F 4 -
(F) 3u-F7=m (3) H,-
(i) == (i) ®, “UF AT I G AT STAT 9561 3T TAL F T UL “TH gL FTHTAT
TTAT” 953 3T 3T T ST,
(i) &= (i) 37T 3T TLeqH W, “UF gL AHhT STALT” T&a1 37T FAAL] AT AT ATY, IAh T
T I SITY ST STAY 9167 ST STe1¥ T ST,
(@) 3T-FF=w (5) |, “Ii= T WA ST 9Teal 3T AL F ©IH UL “T=AT golle AT
TTAT” 973 3T AT T T4,

(1) 39- = (7) #, “dq |7 TR STAL AT THh A AT ®IF1 FHT AT 677 ST,
oTsaT T AT o TATT UL “USTIHT0T THTT-I57 H HTLH FTH o o[0T UF golT 1S A7 T hT
STAL AT THH qHeT AT EIAT T AT AT SITUITT A7 9167 377 AeAT TG ST |

. 3 A ¥, 7w 34 ®, su-fRaw (3) ®, “uswer siwfar % forw ue &Y TUT 99T 9= 9y v

AfATaT oo 9sal o T U “UFHer Arafed % fore qi= 2T ¢ ¥ &7 gl $90 T (i

[ 9TeR T ST |

. 3 e ¥, R 347 ¥, su-fRaw (3) #, “uwer ity F oo U =Y T qur 9= e w6

faferd e gsal & T U “THe siufer & for g2 §f Tau 9T o9 |7 $9C &7 Afaied goF”

9re% T SATA |

o e o, e 122% 8, sa-Ffag (1) 9, @ (@) 9,-

(i) “TATH ZTT TIW’ 9TR1 F FATH IT “GT AT TATH golT< €UT ” 9768 T STAT;

(if) TES TEF M T TAF |, “THTE g TUT” 9TeaT T 2t T U, Tt off o, 376 T
“UF AT T 95 T AT |

. 3% W H, [ 1229 #, SU-AEH (1) #, ‘99 g9 T ekt & T 9 CREd g Saee
ffawtor % o sraes % A # deg g9 $UT S HAa g @3S F A SEad & o Uh
AT 0" 9167 T T4 |

. 39 fRaw ¥, g 1297 9 -

F. SO-FH (1) §, “YETET TR F TAE F1E F o7 & Y ST THATE ST STAT AT 390 TG0
WA ®U” 9Teal 3T FeAT0 F T 9T “TETEA AT F TedF aie & o av gene st
STAT AT I THIT T TIC AT TedF AL 5 (o0 TATT JHTHT STAT FT ok A7
T AT T ST,

g, I7-fAT (5) § “UeF A AT ST oreal 3i¥ STeALH €A UL “Ui= |7 TR STee” 9rex 37
AT T ST |

[T, &. Ta.11014/32/2018-S13117]
TT. AAGIT & 9IS, S afaa



[ 9T I-E0S 3(i)] YRA 1 SIS ; SHEROT 3

feroqur: o R srferg=mT S U.28-10/45-t= (1), arE 21 fadew, 1945 T wd F o H
TR 3 0 o i sifawr Serrer srferg=mT wear ar.FLE. 1186 (31), ara 7 faday, 2018 g
ERIREIRI

MINISTRY OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE
(Department of Health and Family Welfare

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 12" December, 2018

G.S.R. 1193(E).—Whereas the draft of certain rules further to amend the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules,
1945 was published as required under sections 12 and section 33 of the Drugs and Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of
1940), vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Health and Family Welfare (Department
of Health and Family Welfare), number G.S.R. 1000(E), dated the 5t October, 2018 in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), inviting objections and suggestions from all persons likely to
be affected thereby, before the expiry of a period of fifteen days from the date on which the copies of the
Official Gazette containing the said notification were made available to the public;

And whereas, copies of the Gazette were made available to the public on the 10" October, 2018;

And whereas, objections and suggestions received from the public on the said rules have been
considered by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 12 and section 33 of the Drugs and
Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of 1940), the Central Government, after consultation with the Drugs Technical
Advisory Board, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945,
namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Drugs and Cosmetics (Tenth Amendment) Rules, 2018.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 24,-
(a) in sub-rule (1),-

(i) for the words “one thousand rupees for a single drug and an additional fee at the rate of
one hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees for a single drug and an
additional fee at the rate of one thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) in the proviso, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (3), for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees shall be paid”, the words “one
thousand five hundred rupees shall be paid for making amendment in the licence or” shall be
substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 24A,-
(a) in sub-rule (3),-

(i) in clause (i), for the words and letters “one thousand and five hundred US dollars”, the
words and letters “ten thousand US dollars” shall be substituted;

(i1) in clause (ii) and proviso thereto, for the words and letters “one thousand US dollars”
wherever they occur, the words and letters “five thousand US dollars” shall be

substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (5), for the words and letters “five thousand US dollars”, the words and letters
“twenty five thousand US dollars” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-rule (7), for the words and letters “three hundred US dollars or its equivalent in
Indian rupees shall be paid”, the words and letters “one thousand eight hundred US dollars



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

or its equivalent in Indian rupees shall be paid for making amendment in the registration
certificate or” shall be substituted.

4. In the said rules, in rule 34, in sub-rule (3), for the words “one hundred rupees for a single drug
and an additional fee of fifty rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees for a single drug and an
additional fee of two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

s. In the said rules, in rule 34A, in sub-rule (3), for the words “one hundred rupees for a single drug
and an additional fee of fifty rupees”, the words “six hundred rupees for a single drug and an
additional fee of three hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In the said rules, in rule 122A, in sub-rule (1), in clause (b),-

(1) for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(ii) in the first proviso and in the second proviso, for the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, at
both the places where they occur, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

7.  In the said rules, in rule 122D, in sub-rule (1), for the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, the words
“fifteen thousand in case of application for manufacture of the fixed dose combinations and one
lakh rupees in case of import application of the fixed dose combinations” shall be substituted..

8. In the said rules, in rule 129A -

(a) in sub-rule (1), for the words and letters, “two hundred and fifty US dollars or its equivalent
to Indian rupees for each brand of cosmetic”, the words and letters “two thousand US dollars
or its equivalent to Indian rupees for each brand of cosmetic and a fee of fifty US dollars for
each variant” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (5), for the words and letters “one hundred US dollars”, the words and letters
“five hundred US dollars” shall be substituted.

[F. No. X.11014/32/2018-DR]
Dr. MANDEEP K BHANDARL, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India vide notification number F.28-10/45-H(1),
dated the 21% December, 1945 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R. 1186(E), dated the
7™ December, 2018.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. A I_O K Digitally signed
by ALOK KUMAR

Date: 2018.12.17
KU MA R 15:40:04 +05'30'



